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Fwd: [IIUMEJ] : "1842" Editor Decision - Accept

3 messages

ismy anissa <ismyanissa@gmail.com>

To: sha hezri <shaimihezri@iium.edu.my>

Regards,

Nurul Anissa Mohd Asri

Research Assistant

Department of Manufacturing and Materials Engineering
Faculty of Engineering

International Islamic University Malaysia

53100 Kuala Lumpur

Begin forwarded message:
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From: Hazleen Anuar via [lUM Engineering Journal <iiumej@iium.edu.my>
Date: 10 June 2021 at 21:08:52 MYT

To: nurul anissa mohd asri <ismyanissa@gmail.com>

Subject: [IUMEJ] : "1842" Editor Decision - Accept

Reply-To: Hazleen Anuar <hazleen@iium.edu.my>

Dear nurul anissa mohd asri, ABDUL MALEK ABDUL HAMID, NORHASHIMAH SHAFFIAR, NOR AIMAN
SUKINDAR, SHARIFAH IMIHEZRI SYED SHAHARUDDIN, FARID SYAZWAN HASSAN:

Congratulation!!! According to our record, your manuscript ID #"1842," entitled "APPLICATION OF HOUSE
OF QUALITY IN THE CONCEPTUAL DESIGN OF BATIK WAX EXTRUDER AND PRINTER" has been
accepted for publication in the IIUM Engineering Journal (IIUMEJ).

We request you to upload your camera-ready manuscript through the system by responding to this
discussion by clicking Add Message and uploading files as Attached files within 2 weeks of this
notification. For details for the preparation of the manuscript, please visit the journal website at
http://journals.iium.edu.my/ejournal/index.php/iiumej/about/submissions.

Download
Journal template Journal reference style

You can also find the Journal template and other related information in the Submission Library under
View Document Libray at the right top corner when clicking your paper title after login into the journal site.

You are also requested to update contributor author(s) if all authors' names are not in the database by
following the Update Author List's guidelines in the Document Library.

You are also advised to pay a publication processing fee of USD 150 (overseas bank transaction) | RM
600.00 (through online overseas transfer) for outside Malaysia paper and RM 500.00 for local author
(Malaysia) paper by two weeks of this notification and send us the proof of payment by through the
system by responding to this discussion by clicking Add Message and uploading files as Attached
files within 2 weeks of this notification.

The payment can be made in the following mode to bank account:

"By Cash Counter at BMMB, or Electronic Transfer or Telegraphic Transfer (TT) "

sha hezri <shaimihezri@iium.edu.my>

Fri, Jun 11, 2021 at 8:29 AM
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Name: UIAM Operating Account

Bank: Bank Muamalat Malaysia Berhad

Account No: 14070000004716

Swift Code: BMMBMYKL

Branch: International Islamic University Malaysia (IlUM), Gombak, Selangor
Country: Malaysia

Via ONLINE

at https://landing-pages.flywire.com/landing/iium by choosing Publication Fee amounting to RM 600 (which
is approx USD 150) - for overseas author and RM 500 for a local author.

Normally, the pre-publication process takes up to six months. During this period, galley proofs will be sent to

you for checking and corrections purposes. The galley proofs must be returned to IUMEJ within 7 calendar
days. Furthermore, you are responsible for any error in the published paper due to your oversight.

Thank you for your contribution to lUMEJ, and we hope you will consider submitting an article to IUMEJ
again in the future.

Thanking you.

IIUM Engineering Journal

@ G-Application of house of quality in the conceptual design of batik Correction (Final).docx
1903K

ismy anissa <ismyanissa@gmail.com> Mon, Jul 5, 2021 at 11:07 AM
To: sha hezri <shaimihezri@iium.edu.my>

Begin forwarded message:

From: ismy anissa <ismyanissa@gmail.com>

Date: 11 June 2021 at 08:29:24 MYT

To: sha hezri <shaimihezri@iium.edu.my>

Subject: Fwd: [IUMEJ] : "1842" Editor Decision - Accept

[Quoted text hidden]

@ G-Application of house of quality in the conceptual design of batik Correction (Final).docx
1903K

sha hezri <shaimihezri@iium.edu.my> Wed, Aug 4, 2021 at 12:37 PM
To: "A. H. M. ZAHIRUL ALAM Alam" <zahirulalam@iium.edu.my>
Cc: ismy anissa <ismyanissa@gmail.com>
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Assalamualaikum Prof. Zahirul,

Recently, article submission ID1842 has been accepted by [IUM Engineering Journal. The processing publication
has also been paid. May | know the status from finance and the receipt as well?

Thank you.

Kind Regards;

Dr. Sharifah Imihezri Syed Shaharuddin
Google Scholar : https://scholar.google.com/citations?user=swbxvvsAAAAJ&hl=en

https://shaimihezri.wixsite.com/sharifah-imihezri

Assistant Professor,

Department of Manufacturing and Materials Engineering,
Kuliyyah of Engineering

International Islamic University Malaysia,

Gombak, Malaysia.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: ismy anissa <ismyanissa@gmail.com>
[Quoted text hidden]
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